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Graphics Standards

THE SIGNATURE

What is the signature?

The signature is a graphic element 
comprised of two parts—a name-
plate (typographic rendition) of the 
university/campus name and an 
underscore, accompanied by the 
UH seal. The UH Mānoa signature 
is shown here as an example. Sys-
tem and campus signatures follow. 
Both vertical and horizontal formats 
of the signature are provided. The 
signature may also be used without 
the seal on communications where 
the seal cannot be clearly repro-
duced, space is limited or there is 
another compelling reason to omit 
the seal.

How is color incorporated?

When using the University of 
Hawai‘i signature system, only the 
underscore and seal in its entirety 
should be used in the specified 
two-color scheme. When using the 
signature alone, only the under-
score should appear in its specified 
color.

Are there restrictions in using 
the signature?

Yes. Do not

• alter the signature artwork, colors 
or font.

• alter the placement or propor-
tion of the seal respective to the 
nameplate.

• stretch, distort or rotate the 
signature.

• box or frame the signature or use 
over a complex background.
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Manifestly covariant Lagrangian density with minimal coupling
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• Recasted Lagrangian density for a superconducting many-fermion system
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